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February 24, 1923 
 

  FISH HATCHERY MAN HAS EXCITING TRIP TO LAKE 
 
 

 Seth Meadows, who is employed at the 
Baker lake fish hatchery, made the trip to the 
lake last Friday, just following the snow 
storm, and had an exciting time before he 
reached his destination. He left Concrete in 
the forenoon on a saddle horse and leading 
two pack horses. He made the trip easily until 
some distance beyond the ranger station on the 
Baker River, when he found the trail filled by 
snow slides and traveling difficult. When he 
reached the 15-mile board he was compelled 
to unpack and leave his pack horses and 
continue with his saddle horse, alternately 
riding and walking.   When he had gone a 
short distance farther he ran into a heavy slide 
and in digging a trail through the horse broke 
away and in some way went over the bank 
into the canyon. As it was quite dark at that 
time, he could not see what became of the 
horse, but naturally concluded that it had been 
killed, so went on foot until he reached a 
forestry service cabin, where he camped for 
the night, walking on in to the lake Saturday 
morning. Meanwhile his non-arrival caused 
uneasiness among the crew at the lake, and 
after several telephone messages along the 
line, searching parties were formed and 
covered a part of the trail. After a good rest 
Meadows was none the worse for his trip; the 
horse presumed killed managed to get back on 
the trail and was found Saturday, unhurt, so no 
damage was done. However, Meadows is not 
anxious to make the trip again after a heavy 
fall of snow. 
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